# VILLAGE BOARD OF TRUSTEES MAY 20, 2019 MEETING 7:00 P.M.

MAYOR/BOARD	
	Approve April 15, 2019 minutes
	Review/Approve Requests from WBCC for First Friday Activities listed in letter
	Resolution #9-2019/Accredited Delegate to MEUA
	3rd Annual Run for Bereda 5K Run and 1 Mi. Walk
	Request to have vehicle marked with signs in the Memorial Day
	Parade to represent Westfield Memorial Hospital
	Annex 25 Grand Opening
	Request by Westfield Ministerial Association to have a "Block Party"
	at Welch Field on Friday, July 19th
POLICE DEPARTI	MENT
	Monthly/Overtime Report
	Discuss Officer Justina Preston / Fit Team
	Request carryover of 10 vacation days
FIRE DEPARTME	NT
	Monthly Report
	Approval of Fire Department Members, Jordan Ellis, Mike Paternosh,
	Jr., Venn Cleland, and Nancy Rose.
RECREATION DE	
	Program Report
	Approve hiring of Seasonal Employees
CODE ENFORCE	MENT DEPARTMENT
	Monthly Report
<b>PUBLIC WORKS I</b>	DEPARTMENT
	Monthly/Overtime Report
	Declare Equipment / Vehicle as Surplus.
<b>WATER &amp; SEWER</b>	REPARTMENT
	Monthly/Overtime Report
	Approval to hire MRB Group for design and bidding for Minton Pump
	Station replacement
ELECTRIC DEPAI	
	Monthly/Overtime Reports
	Approval of Change Order for Rt. 5 Reconductoring-Ferguson
	Electric
	Approve General Line Construction Material Bid
TREASURER	
	Monthly/Overtime Report
	Revenue Expense Reports
	March Financials
CLERK	
	Monthly/Overtime Report
	Warrants

**QUESTIONS FROM VISITORS** 

# VILLAGE BOARD OF TRUSTEES MAY 20, 2019 MINUTES

Mayor Michael VandeVelde presiding

MEMBERS: Dennis Lutes, Al Holbrook, Mike Catalano, Rob Cochran

OTHERS: Becky Jackson, Becki-Betts Paternosh, Ed LeBarron, Andrew Webster,

Andrew Thompson, Bonnie Rae Strickland, Robert Genthner, Edward Slate, Bill Christ, Deb Puckhaber, Marsha Holland, Rachel Jaynes, Ann

Kneer, Julie Kleven, Jerry Kleven

### MAYOR/BOARD

MINUTES

The board made a motion to approve the April 15<sup>th</sup> minutes as amended by Trustee Catalano, seconded by Trustee Lutes and was carried unanimously.

### REQUEST FOR FIRST FRIDAY ACTIVITIES

The board made a motion by Trustee Holbrook, seconded by Trustee Catalano and was carried unanimously to approve the request by WBCC for First Friday activities as listed in their letter, (see attached).

### RESOLUTION #9-2019/ACCREDITED DELEGATE TO MEUA

The board made a motion by Trustee Cochran, seconded by Trustee Lutes and was carried unanimously to approve the following Resolution:

WHEREAS, the Village of Westfield, New York, is a municipal member of the Municipal Electric Utilities Association of New York State, and

WHEREAS, the Semi-Annual Meeting of the Municipal Electric Utilities Association of New York State has been called on May 22<sup>nd</sup> to be held at the Embassy Suites by Hilton at Destiny USA, 311 Hiawatha Blvd. West, Syracuse, New York, 13204 and,

WHEREAS, in accordance with the bylaws of the Municipal Electric Utilities Association of New York State, each municipal member may cast one vote on each transaction properly brought before this meeting,

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that DPW Director, Andrew Thompson, be and is hereby designated as the accredited delegate of the Village of Westfield, New York

RESOLUTION #10-2019/ROUND 3 OF DOWNTOWN REVITALIZATION INITIATIVE
The board made a motion to approve the following Resolution by Trustee Catalano,
seconded by Trustee Holbrook and was carried unanimously.

WHEREAS, as part of Governor Andrew Cuomo's Regional Economic Development Councils, Round 3 of the Downtown Revitalization Initiative provides an opportunity for one downtown from each of the 10 regional economic development councils to be

nominated by their respective council for the award for which the submission must come from the respective municipal government; and

WHEREAS, in conjunction to the DRI process, up to \$10 million in each of the 10 communities will be made available to aid in the transformation of communities to advance high quality-of-life and a critical mass of diverse public amenities and activities serve as catalysts for increased and sustainable local economic development.; and

WHEREAS, In the Western New York region, applicants to the DRI that are not nominated as the \$10 million winner of the 2018 statewide competition, will automatically be eligible for additional funding for transformative improvements to their downtowns through the Smart Growth Community Fund available through Phase II of the Buffalo Billion; and

WHEREAS, the Town and Village of Westfield maintain a collaborative intermunicipal relationship and a joint comprehensive plan; and

WHEREAS, the Town and Village of Westfield and the Westfield Development Corporation have a common interest in promoting economic development and prosperity in Westfield; and

WHEREAS, there are significant public and private investments taking place downtown Westfield and at Barcelona Harbor and opportunity to advance and leverage additional growth and development of historic downtown and Lake Erie waterfront; now

BE IT RESOLVED that the Village Board of Trustees is in full support of the submission to the WNY REDC an intermunicipal application for the 2018 Downtown Revitalization Downtown Revitalization Initiative and WNY Smart Growth Community Fund, and be it

FURTHER RESOLVED that the Village Board of Trustees authorizes the Mayor to execute all necessary documents with the REDC and the New York State Department of State should the Town and Village be successful in securing funding for said downtown revitalization efforts.

### 3RD ANNUAL RUN FOR BEREDA

The board made a motion to approve the Annual Run for Bereda 5K Run and 1 mi. Walk by Trustee Holbrook, seconded by Trustee Catalano and was carried unanimously.

### REQUEST FOR VEHICLE IN MEMORIAL DAY PARADE

The board made a motion to approve for having a vehicle marked with signs representing Westfield Hospital in the Memorial Day parade to Trustee Holbrook, seconded by Trustee Lutes and was carried unanimously.

### 25 ANNEX GRAND OPENING

The board made a motion by Trustee Holbrook, seconded by Trustee Lutes and was carried unanimously to approve for Annex 25 request to have their Grand Opening on Friday, May 31<sup>st</sup> at 5:00 p.m. and to allow alcohol within a roped in area of the sidewalk and have music beginning at 6:30 p.m., and for a request for July 19<sup>th</sup> & 20<sup>th</sup> as well.

### POLICE DEPARTMENT

### MONTHLY OVERTIME REPORT

The board made a motion to approve the Monthly Report and Overtime Report of 15.5 hours by Trustee Cochran, seconded by Trustee Catalano and was carried unanimously.

### JUSTINA PRESTON/FIT TEAM

The board made a motion to approve Officer Justina Preston for training and becoming part of Fit Team by Trustee Lutes, seconded by Trustee Cochran and was carried unanimously.

### CARRYOVER OF VACATION

The board made a motion to approve for Chief Genthner to carryover 10 vacation days by Trustee Catalano, seconded by Trustee Holbrook and was carried unanimously.

### FIRE DEPARTMENT

MONTHLY REPORT

To be given at next month's meeting.

APPROVAL OF NEW MEMBERS

The board made a motion to approve the following new members by Trustee Catalano, seconded by Trustee Cochran; abstained by Trustee Holbrook, the motion was carried: Jordan Ellis, Mike Paternosh, Jr., Ben Cleland, and Nancy Rose.

### RECREATION DEPARTMENT

MONTHLY REPORT

The board made a motion to approve the Program Report by Trustee Lutes, seconded by Trustee Cochran and was carried unanimously.

### SEASONAL EMPLOYEES

The board made a motion by Trustee Catalano, seconded by Trustee Holbrook and was carried unanimously to approve the hiring and rates of the Seasonal employees as presented. (See attached)

The board briefly discussed the possibility of offering an incentive for potential Lifeguards to help cover the cost for taking the Course.

### **CODE ENFORCEMENT**

MONTHLY REPORT

The board made a motion by Trustee Lutes, seconded by Trustee Catalano and was carried unanimously to approve the Monthly Report given by the Code Enforcement Officer.

### **PUBLIC WORKS**

MONTHLY/OVERTIME REPORT

The board made a motion to approve the Monthly Report and Overtime report of 15.40 hours by Trustee Catalano, seconded by Trustee Cochran and was carried unanimously.

### **DECLARE SURPLUS**

The board made a motion by Trustee Holbrook, seconded by Trustee Lutes and was carried unanimously to declare equipment and vehicle as surplus as listed and presented, (see attached).

### **WATER & SEWER DEPARTMENT**

MONTHLY AND OVERTIME REPORT

The board approved the Monthly Report and Overtime Report of 22.05 hours for Sewer Dept. on a motion made by Trustee Lutes, seconded by Trustee Cochran and was carried unanimously.

The board made a motion to approve the Monthly Report and Overtime Report of 29.04 hours for Water Dept. by Trustee Lutes, seconded by Trustee Catalano and was carried unanimously.

### MINTON PUMP STATION REPLACEMENT

The board made a motion to approve for hiring MRB Group for design and bidding for Minton Pump Station replacement by Trustee Holbrook, seconded by Trustee Lutes and was carried unanimously.

### **ELECTRIC DEPARTMENT**

MONTHLY OVERTIME REPORT

The board made a motion to approve the Monthly Report and Overtime Report of 24.0 hours by Trustee Catalano, seconded by Trustee Cochran and was carried unanimously.

### CHANGE ORDER FOR RT. 5 RECONDUCTORING

The board made a motion to approve the change order for Route 5
Reconductoring to Ferguson Electric in the amount of \$15,495 by Trustee Lutes, seconded by Trustee Holbrook and was carried unanimously.

### GENERAL LINE CONSTRUCTION MATERIAL BID

The board made a motion to approved the General Line Construction Material bid as shown on the attached sheet on a motion made by Trustee Cochran, seconded by Trustee Catalano and was carried unanimously.

### **TREASURER**

MONTHLY AND OVERTIME REPORT

The board made a motion to approve the ½ hour Overtime Report by Trustee Lutes, seconded by Trustee Cochran and was carried unanimously.

REVENUE AND EXPENSE REPORTS & MARCH FINANCIALS

The board made a motion to /approve the Revenue and Expense Reports and the March Financials by Trustee Catalano, seconded by Trustee Holbrook and was carried unanimously.

## **CLERK**WARRANTS

The following warrants for 5/6 and 5/20 were approved on a motion made by Trustee Catalano, seconded by Trustee Cochran and was carried unanimously.

General	W#53	\$45,655.33
Electric	W#58	132,322.11
Water	W#63	69,711.05
Sewer	W#58	22,939.10
E. Dist.	W#59	102,866.00
Water Proj.	W#64	172,452.71
Comm. Enhance	W#40	3,500.00
WPCF upgrade	W#41	4,737.98
General	W#55	47,712.76
Electric	W#61	192,177.24
Water	W#66	19,448.43
Sewer	W#60	100,483.51
Electric Dist.	W#62	22,600.00
WPCF	W#42	314,450.00
Water Project	W#67	572,967.68

### OTTAWAY PARK REQUEST

The board discussed the request for use of Ottaway Park for a wedding to be held "past season". It was noted an Attendant would have to be hired for that particular event as the regularly scheduled Attendant can not work past a 90-day period of time.

The board noted they would approve the request for use of Ottaway Park with the charge of \$110 based on ½ day plus 5 hours of the Attendant's time on a motion made by Trustee Catalano, seconded by Trustee Holbrook and was carried unanimously.

The board did agree that a new Policy should be put into effect and would be discussed in the near future to make modifications.

### **EXECUTIVE SESSION**

The board made a motion to enter into Executive Session to discuss Personnel issues by Trustee Cochran, seconded by Trustee Lutes and was carried unanimously.

Following the Executive Session, the board made a motion to adjourn and reenter regular session on a motion made by Trustee Holbrook, seconded by Trustee Lutes and was carried unanimously. There was no action taken as a result of the Executive Session.

There being no further business to come before the board the meeting was adjourned on a motion made by Trustee Cochran, seconded by Trustee Holbrook and was carried unanimously.

April 25, 2019

7539 East Route #20

Westfield, New York

To Mayor VandeVelde and Village Board Members:

The Westfield Barcelona Community Chamber of Commerce and The Village Beautification Committee are in the process of planning "First Friday Evenings and The Lincoln Festival ~ "Remembering Lincoln". By popular request and in an effort to expose locals and visitors to the beauty and unique attractions of our community, we plan to expand and enhance First Friday attractions and bring back The Lincoln Festival.

First and foremost, our plan is to take steps to insure the safety of patrons, and to act responsibly with regard to the use and care of village streets and facilities. We will address and comply with insurance requirements, and will enlist help in policing street crossings and alcohol use.

That being stated we ask that the Board grant us permission to:

- hold activities in the areas listed below
- allow the service of alcohol and beer and relax open container laws in these areas

The requested areas include:

- South and North side of Main Street from the viaduct to Pearl Street®
- North Portage Street from Main Street to Clinton Street
- South Portage Street from Main Street to McClurg Street
- Market Street from Main Street to Clinton Street
- Elm Street from Main Street to McClurg Street
- Moore Park and Gazebo
- Community Blue and Key Bank Parking Lots

Set up for First Fridays will likely begin at 4:00 pm each day. The Lincoln Festival will run all day throughout the weekend. Ending times will vary with the nature of the day's activities.

The requested dates for First Fridays and The Lincoln Festival are as listed below:

- June 7, 2019......Also June 7, 8 and 9 for The Lincoln Festival ~ "Remembering Lincoln"
- July 12, 2019 2<sup>nd</sup> Friday (Reunion Weekend)

• August 2, 2019
• September 6, 2019
October 4, 2019 (Possibly)
Feel free to call me with questions or concerns (326-3504 or 753-6043).
On behalf of the Westfield Barcelona Chamber of Commerce and the Village Beautification
Committee, I am grateful for your consideration of our proposal, and I await your response.
er and
Sincerely,
Marihu Harreson
Marilyn Hemmer

### Rec. Dept. 2019 Seasonal Employees

\*Indicates an employee who is a new

\*Joshua McCord: Director of Summer Programs/Recreation Specialist
-Full-Time (40 Hours a week) \$12.00

### **Pool Staff**

-Please note that since we no longer have a Pool Director or a Head of Pool Staff, we will rely on our Head Lifeguards to oversee the shift they're working. Therefore, the Head Lifeguard for each shift will make an additional 50 cents per hour. The employees are listed below in order of seniority and/or experience which we use to determine who the Head Lifeguard will be for each shift.

1.) Leah Marsala-Chase: Lifeguard
-Part Time (less than 10 hours a week) \$12.05
-WSI

2.) Matthew Eggleston: Lifeguard
-Part-Time (about 10 Hours a week) \$12.05
-WSI

3.) Mary Benson: Lifeguard -Part-Time (15-20 Hours a week) \$11.80

4.) Nancy Jopek: Lifeguard
-Part-Time (about 20 Hours a week) \$13.55
-Instructor rate \$15.00

-Lifeguard Instructor, CPR/AED for Professional Rescuers Instructor, WSI Trainer, WSI, First Aid/CPR/AED Instructor, Aqua Instructor, Certified Pool Operator

5.) Abigail Jopek: Lifeguard -Full-Time (35-40 Hours a week) \$12.05 -WSI

6.) Brenna Wright: Lifeguard -Full-Time (35-40 Hours a week) \$11.80

7.) Bethany Schaaf: Lifeguard -Full Time (35-40 Hours a week) \$11.40

8.) Colby Bills: Lifeguard -Full-Time (35-40 Hours a week) \$11.40

9.) Rachel Mathews: Lifeguard -Part-Time (Can Only Work Session 3) \$11.20

10.) Jordan Czak: Lifeguard
-Part-Time (About 20 Hours a Week) \$11.20

11.) Collin Genthner: Lifeguard
-Part-Time (About 20 Hours a Week) \$11.20

12.) \*Owen Bates: Lifeguard -Part-Time (About 20 Hours a Week) \$11.10

13.) \*Timothy Mead-Colgrove: Lifeguard -Part-Time (About 20 Hours a Week) \$11.10

### Field Staff

-Please note that since we no longer have a Field Director or a Head of Field Staff, we will rely on our most experienced staff member to oversee the shift they're working. Therefore, the Head Staff person for each shift will make an additional 50 cents per hour. The employees are listed below in order of seniority and/or experience which we use to determine who the Head Staff person will be for each shift.

1.) Wade Dellow: Recreation Aide -Part-Time (20 Hours a week) \$11.10

2.) Jared Winder: Recreation Aide -Full-Time (30 Hours a week) \$10.70

T-3.) Sydnee Abele: Recreation Aide -Full-Time (Hours a week) \$10.70

<u>T-3.) Taylor Kassman:</u> Recreation Aide -Full-Time (Hours a week) \$10.70

5.) Brock Schuster: Recreation Aide -Full-Time (30 Hours a week) \$10.50

# VILLAGE OF WESTFIELD SURPLUS EQUIPMENT

AUCTION PRICE	\$1,325.00	\$2,650.00	\$475.00	\$10.00		\$63.02	\$220.00	\$3,025.00	\$2,950.00				\$10.00	,			\$31.00	\$285.00			\$385.00			\$180.00		\$36.00	\$21.00	\$71.00	\$3,400.00	\$1,650.00	\$25.00	\$28.00	\$236.00	\$10.00
DESCRIPTION	TRUCK MOUNT LEAF VACUM MACHINE WISCONSIN ENGINE - 4829387	SIDEWALK PLOW W/ (1) EXTRA SET TRACK	SUV - 96,164 MILES	22" PUSH LAWN MOWER	22" PUSH LAWN MOWER	DRILL PRESS & RADIAL ARM SAW	WATER TANK	POLICE CAR	DUMP TRUCK	WATER FITTINGS	WATER FITTINGS	WATER FITTINGS	WATER FITTINGS	WATER FITTINGS	WATER FITTINGS	WATER FITTINGS	WATER FITTINGS		PUMP	HYDRO BLITZ	PICK-UP TRUCK	ELECTRIC GENERATOR - 550 HRS - ALLIS-CHALMER - DIESEL	LINCOLN	TOSHIBA	TOSHIBA	GOULD								
DEPT	PWD	PWD	PWD	PWD	PWD	PWD	PWD	POLICE	s/w	WATER	WATER	WATER	WATER	WATER	WATER	WATER	WATER	WATER	WPCF	WPCF	WPCF	WPCF	WPCF	WPCF	WPCF	WPCF								
SSN	165316	002760080	1FMZU72K24UC05347	74282107412034	74282107412036			1FAHP2L81DG157762	1FDWF37541EB99006	ſW	Ñ	W	FLANGED	W	FLANGED	M	FLANGED	6.9 - 7.22	6.84 - 7.16	8.99 - 9.22	9.24 - 9.52	8.99 - 9.45	8.99 - 9.22	11.04 - 11.48	11.10 - 11.60				3GCEK14V06G251939	G750962592				
MODEL#	3000 FM	SW-48	EXPLORER	22-265X8H	22-265X8H			TAURUS	F-350 DUMP TRK	(1) 12" X 45	(2) 6" x 90	(5) 8" X 45	(2) 8" X 22.5	(1) 8"	(1) 6"X6"X4"	(1) 8"X 6"	(e) 6"X2"X6"	,,9 (8)	(1) 6"	(1) 8" X 2" TAP	(4) 8"	.,8 (9)	(3) 8"	(1) 10"	(4) 10"	(1) 12"			1500	60.0 PYA 15R/9170F	50 HP - 364T - 3 PH	40 HP - 324T - 3 PH	40 HP - 324T - 3 PH	6"X6"X17"
MAKE	GIANT-VAC	BOMBARDIER	FORD	MURRY	MURRY	ROCKWELL	300 GAL PLASTIC WATER TANK	FORD	FORD	ELBOW	ELBOW	ELBOW	ELBOW	TEE	TEE	REDUCER	TEE	DRESSER / COUPLER	GATE VALVE	AIR DIAPHRAM PUMP	PRESSURE WASHER	CHEVY	ONAN	ELECTRIC MOTOR	ELECTRIC MOTOR	ELECTRIC MOTOR - NEW	WATER PUMP							
DATE	1984	1980	2004					2013	2001														1						2005					
ITEM #	7	2	m	4		2	9	_	8	თ							ដ	11		12				13		14	13	16	17	18	51	20	77	22

# JUNE AUCTION

į		JUNE AUCTION					05/20/19
	1986	FERGUNSON	46A	3374	PWD	DOUBLE DRUM ROLLER	
		WEN POWER	6.5 HD	92522090	PWD	3000-WATT GENERATOR	
	2005	FORD	F-350 UTILITY TRK	1FDWF37PX5EA08528	s/w	UTILITY TRUCK	
	2005			100804438	s/w	AIR COMPRESSOR - KOHLER 12.5 HP ENGINE - 175 PSI	
		ELECTRIC MOTOR	(3) 40 HP - 324T - 3 PH		WPCF	TOSHIBA	
		WACKER	WI185	800626	WATER	2400-WATT GENERATOR - WISCONSIN ENGINE	
		ONAN	3.0KW-3P/1A	406563	WATER	3600-WATT GENERATOR	
		DRESSER / COUPLER	(4) 12"	13.20 - 13.50	WATER	WATER FITTINGS	
		DRESSER / COUPLER	(2) 12 TRANSITION		WATER	WATER FITTINGS	

# JUNE TRADE-IN

	אוו אטראוון אווטנ					05/20/19
2011	JOHN DEERE	009	1FF060DXJBG280856	PWD	EXCAVATOR TRADE-IN TOWARDS 2019 JD 60G EXCAVATOR	\$33,500.00
2014	CASE	TR270	NEM482526	PWD	TRACK LOADER TRADE-IN TOWARDS 2019 JD 325 TRACK LOADER	\$33,455.00
2016	JOHN DEERE	Z920M	1TC920MCCGTO41627 PWD	PWD	MOWER TRADE-IN TOWARDS 2019 JD Z-TURN MOWER	\$3,820.00
					The second secon	

	3010 ED. 03				
	General Line Cons				
DPW Unit#	Description	Manufacturer Quoted	Part # Quoted	Vendor	Unit Price
	Meter Sockets				
547	200 AMP OVERHEAD	SIEMENS	UAT317-OFP	SCOTT ELECTRIC	32,54
548	200 AMP UNDERGROUND	SIEMENS	UAT417-OPRG	SCOTT ELECTRIC	35.11
550	1.25" METER SOCKET HUB	SIEMENS	HE8598-2	SCOTT ELECTRIC	3.74
552	2" METER SOCKET HUB	SIEMENS	H38599-2	SCOTT ELECTRIC	3.74
	Bolts and Hardware				
118	5/8" X 12" MACHINE BOLT	HUBBELL	8812	NO BID	
611	5/8" X 14" MACHINE BOLT	HUBBELL	8814	NO BID	
127	5/8" X 20" DOUBLE ARMING BOLT	MACLEAN	18870	NO BID	
128	5/8" X 22" DOUBLE ARMING BOLT	MACLEAN	18872	NO BID	
135	BRACE BOLT 3/8 X 4 5"	нивветт	860412	NO BID	
142	BRACE, ALLEY ARM, 7 FT.	HUBBELL	6984	NO BID	
143	CROSSARM BRACE	MACLEAN	JA5526	NO BID	
239	AERIAL SUSPENSION CLAMP	HUBBELL	ASC2	NO BID	
402	5/8" THIMBLEYE NUT	MACLEAN	16510	NO BID	
403	5/8" OVALEYE NUT	HUBBELL	6502	NO BID	
909	1/2" X 4" LAG SCREW, PILOT POINT	COOPER	DF12L4	NO BID	
635	2"X2"X 3/16" FLAT WASHER, 11/16" HOLE	HUBBELL	6813	NO BID	
636	3" X 3" X 1/4" CURVED, 11/16" HOLE WASHER	HUBBELL	682312	NO BID	
	Cutouts and Lightning Arresters				
901	6 KV LIGHTNING ARRESTER	COOPER	URT06050AIA1BIA	NO BID	
623	CUTOUT BLADE, 15 KV, 300 AMP, TYPE C OPEN	HUBBELL	T710133T	NO BID	
979	100 AMP OPEN CUTOUT, 15 KV POLYMER	новвест	CP710114PB	NO BID	
	Fuses				
1018	10 AMP FUSELINK	BUSSMANN	FL3K10	SCOTT ELECTRIC	22.46
6101	15 AMP FUSELINK	BUSSMANN	FL3K15	SCOTT ELECTRIC	22.46
1001	25 AMP FUSELINK	BUSSMANN	FL3K25	SCOTT ELECTRIC	24.46
1002	40 AMP FUSELINK	BUSSMANN	FL3K40	SCOTT ELECTRIC	24.46
1003	SO AMP FUSELINK	BUSSMANN	FL3K50	SCOTT ELECTRIC	24.46
1004	65 AMP FUSELINK	BUSSMANN	FL3K65	SCO'TT ELECTRIC	52.10
1006	100 AMP FUSELINK	BUSSMANN	FL3K100	SCOTT ELECTRIC	52.10
1024	140 AMP FUSELINK	BUSSMANN	FL3K140	SCOTT ELECTRIC	64.71

Hot Line Clamps  231 HOT LINE CLAMP, &  Arms, Insulators, 104 CROSSARM, TREAT 104-1 CROS	Hot Line Clamps  HOT LINE CLAMP, #6 - 336 4  Arms, Insulators, and Pins  CROSSARM, TREATED, 6 PIN, DOUGLAS FIR, 3 1/2" X 4 1/2" X 8 FT  CROSSARM - FIBERGLASS - 8"  INSULATOR, PIN TYPE, 15 KV PORCELAIN  INSULATOR, PIN TYPE, 15 KV POLYMER  5/8" STEEL L V. CROSSARM PIN  Tape  HEAVY DUTY GRADE VINYL ELECTRICAL TAPE (8 5 MIL)  VINYL ELECTRICAL TAPE, 3/4" X 66" PER ROLL  H-Tap Compression Connectors  CONNECTOR, COMPRESSION, #1  CONNECTOR, COMPRESSION, #3  CONNECTOR, COMPRESSION, #4  CONNECTOR, COMPRESSION, #4	HUBBELL.		CIBON	
	UGLAS FIR, 3 1/2" X 4 1/2" X 8 F  CELAIN POLYMER  CTRICAL TAPE (8 5 MIL.)  66' PER ROLL  175	нивветл		NO BID	
	UGLAS FIR, 3 1/2" X 4 1/2" X 8 F  RCELAIN POLYMER  CTRICAL TAPE (8 5 MIL.) 66' PER ROLL  178		S1554AGP		
	NGLAS FIR, 3 1/2" X 4 1/2" X 8 F CCELAIN POLYMER  CTRICAL TAPE (8 5 MIL.) 66' PER ROLL  PTS	0274 0200000			
	POLYMER CTRICAL TAPE (8 5 MIL.) 66 PER ROLL 175	BROUKS MFG	CF-08-6P-NYS	NO BID	
	POLYMER  POLYMER  CTRICAL TAPE (8 5 MIL.)  66' PER ROLL  ors	MACLEAN	PW08LD003-2E	NO BID	
	POLYMER CTRICAL TAPE (8 5 MIL.) 66' PER ROLL 175	NEPO	2355530-7001	NO BID	
	CTRICAL TAPE (8 5 MIL.) 66 PER ROLL 175	HUBBELL	4010150215	NO BID	
	CTRICAL TAPE (8 5 MIL.) 66' PER ROLL 01'S	MACLEAN	12032	NO BID	
	66' PER ROLL  IFS				
	ECTRICAL TAPE, 3/4" X 66' PER ROLL.  Compression Connectors  TOR, COMPRESSION, #1  TOR, COMPRESSION, #3  TOR, COMPRESSION, #4	3 M COMPANY	SUPER 88	SCOTT ELECTRIC	4.79
	Ompression Connectors  TOR, COMPRESSION, #1  TOR, COMPRESSION, #3  TOR, COMPRESSION, #3	3M	SUPER 33+	SCOTT ELECTRIC	4.00
	TOR, COMPRESSION, #1  TOR, COMPRESSION, #3  TOR, COMPRESSION, #3				8 9
	TOR, COMPRESSION, #2 TOR, COMPRESSION, #3 TOR, COMPRESSION, #4	BLACKBURN	WR159	SCOTT ELECTRIC	1.64
	TOR, COMPRESSION, #3 TOR, COMPRESSION, #4	BLACKBURN	WR189	SCOTT ELECTRIC	1.94
	TOR, COMPRESSION, #4	BLACKBURN	WR289	SCOTT ELECTRIC	3.18
2 - 2 - 1 - 1 -		BLACKBURN	WR279	NO BID	
79 Da	CONNECTOR, COMPRESSION, #5	BLACKBURN	WR 379	SCOTT ELECTRIC	3.17
379 114	CONNECTOR, COMPRESSION, #6	BLACKBURN	WR 399	SCOTT ELECTRIC	3.18
	CONNECTOR, COMPRESSION, #7	BLACKBURN	WR 419	SCOTT ELECTRIC	3,18
	STREET LIGHT CONNECTOR	PENN-UNION	KO-R24	SCOTT ELECTRIC	1,65
248 CONNECTO	CONNECTOR, COMPRESSION, CU-CU	KEARNEY	304-82	NO BID	
262 CONNECTO	CONNECTOR COVER, LARGE	BURNDY	ccp	SCOTT ELECTRIC	1.64
263 CONNECTO	CONNECTOR COVER, SMALL	BURNDY	000	SCOTT ELECTRIC	
264 CONNECTO	CONNECTOR, COMPRESSION, CU-CU	KEARNEY	303-82	NO BID	
Automatic Splices	tic Splices				
COPPER:					
$\neg$		HUBBELL	GL-113	NO BID	
- 1		HUBBELL	GL-115	OI8 ON	
1011 6 SOL		HUBBELL	GL-111	NO BID	
ALUMINUM:	UM:				
1010 4/0		HUBBELL	GL-409A	NO BID	,
$\neg$	STR	HUBBELL	GL-4042A	NO BID	
Т		HUBBELL	GL-406A	NO BID	
1028   SPLICE - 1/O - #2 & #4	1/0 - #2 & #4	HUBBEL1.	GL-406A4042A	NO BID	
Compressi	Compression Lugs				
356 COMPRESSI	COMPRESSION LUG 336 4 MCM ALUMINUM 2 HOLE	PENN-UNION	FULA-035-D	SCOTT ELECTRIC	11.94
359 COMPRESSI	COMPRESSION LUG, 4/0 ALUMINUM, 2 HOLE	PENN-UNION	FSLA-025-D	SCOTT ELECTRIC	6,75

DPW	Description	Manufacturer Quoted	Part # Quoted	VENDOR	Unit Price
	Wood Poles - Treated - (Must be delivered by Self-Unloader)				
421	POLE, 45' PINE, CLASS 3 (SYP/Penta/Roof & Brand)	MCFARLAND CASCADE	10DY0045CL03D060	MCFARLAND CASCADE	437 00
422	POLE, 40' PINE, CLASS 3 (SYP/Penta/Roof & Brand)	MCFARLAND CASCADE	10DY0040CL03D060	MCFARLAND CASCADE	363.00
423	POLE, 35' PINE, CLASS 3 (SYP/Penta/Roof & Brand)	MCFARLAND CASCADE 10DY0035CL03D060	10DY0035CL03D060	MCFARLAND CASCADE	287.00
	Split-Bolt Connectors				
259	CONNECTOR, TRANSFORMER GROUND (TANK GROUND)	HUBBLE	KS10	NO BID	
	Guy Wire and Anchors				
736	1/4" GUY WIRE, H.D. GALV. "B" STR., 500FT COIL,	NATIONAL STRAND	EHS014B	NO BID	
738	3/8" GUY WIRE, H.D. GALV "B. STR., 250FT COIL	NATIONAL STRAND	EHS038B	NO BID	
746	3/8" GUY WIRE DEADEND AUTOMATIC	HUBBELL	GDE5202	NO BID	
747	1/4" GUY WIRE DEADEND AUTOMATIC	CHANCE	GDE-700	NO BID	
151	8 000 LB - TOUGH ONE ANCHOR 2 1/4" HUB	HUBBELL	C1025205	OIB ON	
152	PISA ANCHOR ROD - 7 L'THREADED ENDS	HUBBELL	12334P	NO BID	
153	PISA ANCHOR ROD TRIPLEYE	HUBBELL	12585	NO BID	
326	HOOK, GUY	MACLEAN	P345A	NO BID	
325	GUARD, GUY, PLASTIC	A.B.CHANCE	96FRPE	NO BID	
337	FIBERGLASS ROD - GUY STRAIN - 54"	HUBBELL	GS16054CC1	NO BID	
333	FIBERGLASS ROD - GUY STRAIN - 24"	нивветт	GS16024CC1	NO BID	
367	POLE EYE PLATE - 3/4"	MACLEAN	PEP-66-	NO BID	
	Wire				
204	#2 TRIPLEX, "COCKLE"			SCOTT ELECTRIC	0 72
205	1.0 TRIPLEX, "NERITINA"			SCOTT ELECTRIC	1.07
711	#2 ACSR, "PIGNUT"			NO BID	
723	4/O STR ALUM POLY & ACSR (BUCKEYE)			NO BID	
	Street Light Fixtures and Lamps				
462	PHOTOCELL - TWISTLOCK - 120/240 VOLT RATED			SCOTT ELECTRIC	6.50
463	PHOTO CONTROL, 120 VOLT			NO BID	
446-1	STREET/SECURITY LIGHT (LED)			NO BID	
451-1	FLOODLIGHT (LED)	RAB LIGHTING	FXLED 105T/PCT	SCOTT ELECTRIC	469 40
	Miscellaneous Material				
260	GROUND ROD CONNECTOR, 5/8"	BLACKBURN	SS	SCOTT ELECTRIC	1,10
432	5/8" X 8' GROUND ROD, COPPER CLAD			SCOTT ELECTRIC	12.00
627	600A, 15KV HOOK STICK KNIFE SWITCH, POLYMER	HUBBELL	M3D66B	NO BID	
	Dead End Material				
149	SERVICE MAST WIREHOLDER, 1 1/4" - 2 1/2"	MACLEAN	705882	NO BID	
234	CLAMP, DEADEND GALVANIZED, SMALL	HUBBELL	GD-961A	NO BID	
235	CLAMP, DEADEND GALVANIZED, LARGE	HUBBELL	GD963A	NO BID	
312	GRIP, GUY 3/8" GALVANIZED	HUBBELL	FWDE1107	NO BID	
314	GRIP, GUY 1/4" GALVANIZED	Performed Line Products	GDE-1104	NO BID	
316	GRIP, SERVICE 1/0	Performed Line Products	SG-4506	NO BID	
317	GRIP, SERVICE #2	HELICAL	HSG-518	NO BID	
320	GRIP, SERVICE #4	Performed Line Products	SG-4502	NO BID	
612	SPACER, SECONDARY, MIDSPAN TAP	HUBBELL,	GO-53	NO BID	